
North America 
Puzzles Over 
GC Authority
NAD leaders debate the “Total Commitment” statement.

there really are four categories of ac- 
tions. The first action we’re recom- 
mending is to refer to the Health Care 
Summit, which will be held in Decern- 
ber of this year, questions about the 
implementation of the “Total Commit- 
ment” document sections that relate to 
health care institutions. Near the same 
time in the same place the Higher Edu- 
cation Summit will be held, and the next 
one is to refer to the NAD Higher 
Education Summit in December. Ques- 
tions about the implementation of the 
“Total Commitment” document sections 
that relate to colleges/universities are 
the two major ones. Next one is a little 
different—to ask the North American 
Division Office of Education, along with 
the union directors of education to de- 
velop spiritual assessment models for 
use by K-12 schools. The proposed 
models will be submitted to the NAD 
Board of Education, K-12, in February 
1998. And finally to establish a represen- 
tative committee to be determined by 
the chair that would have representa- 
tion from all across the division, espe- 
cially of pastors, to establish procedures 
for implementing other sections of the 
“Total Commitment” document. Num- 
bers 1, 2, and 4 we would propose 
would come back to this meeting in 
October of 1997.

each one take seriously our own rela- 
tionship to the Lord and the responsibil- 
ity that we have as leaders in God’s 
Church for seeing that the resources, 
personnel, the objectives are those that 
are faithful to that which we proclaim 
and that we are doing our very best in 
carrying out that commission. I recog- 
nize that it is possible for some to 
interpret what is being proposed here as 
a heavy hand or a big brother or what- 
ever term one might choose to use. 
However, I don’t believe that is the 
intent. It is not suggesting that we need 
to check up on one another but that we 
do have responsibility as individuals 
and as leaders to see that we are faithful 
to that which we have been called and 
that we are giving the kind of leadership 
that keeps us on task. Now there may be 
comments or questions. However, be- 
fore doing that, before opening the floor 
to that, I would like to propose that 
Elder Jacobsen come forward and share 
with the group the recommendations 
from the division officers and union 
presidents relative to how this docu- 
ment and its response might be handled.

Don J acobsen (A ssistant to the NAD 
P resident): Let me read all four of these 
and then I don’t know if you want to 
deal with them separately or not, but

Readers can make up their oum minds 
about the response o f North America 5׳ 
denominational leaders to the Total 
Commitment document by reading the 

following transcript o f discussion at the 
1996 year-end meetings o f the North 
American Division (NAD). The vice- 
president fo r  education fo r  North 
America, Richard Osborn, distributed 
the transcript—transcribed, from  tape, 
by Osborn's secretary, Elaine Furrow— 
to presidents o f Adventist colleges and  
universities in North America (speakers 
who did not identify themselves are listed 
as “Unknown”)■ Readers will note that 
the wording o f the fin a l action was “to 
receive” the document, not “approve, ” 
“endorse, ” or “adopt, ” all terms avail- 
able and sometimes used by denomina- 
tional bodies in response to other docu- 
ments.

— The Editors

This debate began with a motion 
offered by Harold Baptiste (NAD 
Secretary) that the “Total Com- 

mitment to God” document be adopted 
by the North American Division.

Alfred C. McC lure (NAD President): I
have before us now the document. I 
trust that you understand its intent. I 
believe the purpose of this call is that we



McClure: Right. We’re not voting policy.
I suppose this could come in the arena 
of a guideline.

Unknown: Mr. Chairman, I would sug- 
gest to the body, then, that we ought to 
vote here is a recording in the minutes 
that the document was presented to us, 
but not to reflect in the minutes any kind 
of action that might suggest total accep- 
tance of it. I’m not opposed to the other 
four motions that send it on for further 
discussion and indication of how we 
implement it. But I think any action 
that’s taken here without some of that 
discussion, without knowing what in 
the future may happen to the document, 
may be too much of a bite to take at this 
point.

McClure: Thank you.

J anet W allenkamp(A tlantic Union): This 
document I think I agree with com- 
pletely and the goals are worthwhile 
and noble. I don’t find anything in it 
though that seems new to any of the 
arenas that are mentioned, including 
individual members. And I guess what 
worries me is this constant reference to 
assessment and evaluation means that 
really our commitment to God is some- 
thing we answer to God alone with, and 
it seems to me that in a time where many 
of the church members are worried 
about it being more and more a “top 
down” church rather than a “bottom up” 
church that this adds more to the “top 
down” effect of the church. And I just 
don’t know about the implementation. 
That worries me that our spiritual life 
already has a measurement in the Word 
of God and the Holy Spirit each convict- 
ing us. I think these institutions men- 
tioned may benefit from this as a model 
for their own mission statements, but I 
worry about this reference to assess- 
ment and evaluation.

McClure: Thank you. I think you will 
discover that when it comes to reference 
to the individual member, there is noth- 
ing that suggests an assessment plan. 
That’s for the individual to develop on 
his or her own. Our institutions are not 
islands. They are a part of an organiza- 
tion for which there is responsibility and 
accountability. And I think what is sug- 
gested here is not some “super snoop,” 
but rather that those institutions be

items that you suggested here, and 
normally we set a basis, a framework, a 
theological framework and, as you say, 
we can’t change it here, but I would 
suggest that maybe we would recom- 
mend that they would change the title 
from “Total Commitment” to maybe 
some other title.

McClure: Thank you.

Unknown: Mr. Chairman, a question first 
and then maybe a follow-up comment. 
Explain to me, please, what the intent of 
the motion is or what is the motion. I 
want to be sure what we are discussing.

McClure: The motion is that we accept 
this document as a part of the North 
American Division minutes and then we 
will decide how we want to respond to 
it.

Unknown: And what will that mean if we 
do that?

McClure: It will mean that we are a part 
of the world church that is recognizing 
this document as having been voted by 
the world church and we’re accepting it 
in this division.

Unknown: Is it my incorrect understand- 
ing that the Annual Council voted it as 
a working document, which gives to it 
some sense of perhaps being adjusted 
in the future?

McClure: Elder Baptiste, do you recall 
the exact wording? Elder Thompson is 
here, too. Maybe he could help us with 
that question?

G. Ralph T hompson (GC Secretary): My
understanding, Mr. Chairman, is that 
that is a possibility. It’s a document that 
we will use to improve our effective- 
ness, mission, to integrate mission in all 
aspects of the functioning of the church 
or that it could be modified or expanded 
in later years.

Unknown: In the context of our conver- 
sation yesterday morning about the dif- 
ference between guidelines and policy, 
would it be fair to suggest that a docu- 
ment comes even before guidelines or is 
that synonymous with guidelines or 
policy? I’m trying to determine what it is 
we’re voting.

McClure: All right, thank you. We have 
a motion on the floor now, so we’re not 
probably ready for that motion, but at 
least I thought you ought to hear that 
recommendation before we take an 
action on the motion before us, and 
then we might want to take an action on 
that which was recommended.

Elizabeth Sterndale(N A D W omen’s M in- 
istries D irector): Just as I was hearing it 
read and before I heard these four 
things, I wondered where it would go. 
And it occurred to me that, as you stated, 
it seemed as though it might be a little 
heavy handed kind of thing that we 
were expected to vote on. And I won- 
dered if it would be appropriate to 
footnote it to our mission statement, but 
not have it as a stand-alone document. 
That was before I heard these pieces, so 
I think we need to go on and discuss it 
more, but it just seemed to me that it 
should be a document that attaches to 
our mission statement rather than a 
document that stands alone.

McClure: Are there other comments?

U nknown: Mr. Chairman, I think it is a 
good document, but my concern is the 
title of the document, “Total Commit- 
ment to God.” We as a church con- 
tinue to emphasize doing; it’s what 
you do rather than what you are to 
become. And I’m concerned someone 
might get the idea that I can do these 
things and I’m committed to God. And 
I’ve gone to some churches where you 
have individuals who are able to do all 
of the things that you listed here as a 
pastor, or maybe even in the area of 
education, and they may not be totally 
committed to God. Could we rather 
name this document, “Expectations of 
the Church” rather than “Total Com- 
mitment to God”?

McClure: You m ake a good point, ex- 
cep t that w e d o n ’t have the  op tion  of 
changing the docum ent, even  the title, 
because this is sim ply a docum ent that 
has been  voted  by the w orld  church, so 
it is in place. And therefore w e are 
sim ply considering it as accepting  here  
and  then  deciding w hat to  d o  w ith it.

Unknown: A second concern is that as 
you went through the documents I did 
not discover a biblical basis for all of the



will involve leadership of all those insti- 
tutions in just deciding how to respond 
to it.

G. Edward Reid (NAD Stewardship Di- 
rector): I would like to refer to the very 
first paragraph. Someone asked earlier 
what is the biblical basis for this and 
obviously we have a text there upon 
which the entire document rests. My 
concern is that the text is not spelled out 
completely. I think, personally, from my 
perspective of the great commission or 
the gospel commission that it actually 
has three parts and that is to go teach, to 
baptize, and then teaching them to 
observe all things whatsoever I have 
commanded you. In my personal judg- 
ment, an evangelical Protestant church 
could take this as it stands without that 
third component and we spent a great 
deal of time in the pre-session and also 
when we talked about church planting 
of upholding the unique standards of 
the Adventist Church and of course 
we’ve been talking about Net ’96 and 
what makes the uniqueness of the Ad- 
ventist Church and so on. So I would 
like to see us include the full text. 
Obviously verse 20 is not even written 
out here, but if we’re only going to have 
one text, we should include the whole 
thing which would include teaching 
them to observe all things.

McClure: That you. Your comments are 
being recorded so that we can pass 
them along.

Lenard D. J aecks (W ashington Confer- 
ence P resident): As I listen to Ed Reid’s 
speech and then the other two, I think 
it is very important that we understand 
our personal accountability to God. And 
I know the caution of top-down. I wish 
we didn’t use that quite as often as we 
did because I think God is on the top. 
And the fact of the matter is, as I 
understand the doctrine of the church, 
that yes, we are accountable to God, but 
he has given us a church, a body of 
believers that we are accountable to. 
And I’m afraid, at times, in our earnest- 
ness to talk about our accountability to 
God alone, we bypass the concept that 
God has given to us of mutual account- 
ability. The eye does not say, “I am 
alone.” It is in a body. And I like that 
concept because I want to be account- 
able to God, but I need the members of

gives to us for obedience rather than a 
grace that accepts us as we are without 
having to prove ourselves to God first.
I sense that that is not totally in harmony 
with the gospel, at least as how I under- 
stand it, and as I understand that Sev- 
enth-day Adventists proclaim it. Then 
on page 5, under the section total com- 
mitment regarding colleges and univer- 
sities, in the right-hand column it says, 
“employing fully committed, profession- 
ally competent Seventh-day Adventist 
teachers, who are actively involved in 
their local church, and who integrate 
faith and learning in the context of 
nurturing their students,” and so on.

The last paragraph in that section says 
that there must be a “spiritual master 
plan” developed by each institution, 
and this would be submitted to a Gen- 
eral Conference-appointed international 
panel. A couple of concerns about that— 
first of all, there are occasions when we 
are not able to find Seventh-day Advent- 
ist individuals to fill certain positions, 
and occasionally we need to hire Chris- 
tians who come from other communi- 
ties of faith to serve in our institutions. 
This tends to eliminate that as an option. 
Or, in the very least, if an institution 
does find it necessary to do so, once 
again it gives a basis for significant 
criticism of that institution for function- 
ing outside the recommendations of this 
document. And then I’m wondering 
why is it that the General Conference- 
appointed panel will be the one that will 
evaluate the spiritual master plan of 
institutions that are a part of a division 
and not General Conference institutions 
as such. I can understand Andrews 
University, Loma Linda University doing 
this, but colleges and universities that 
are operated by unions, it would seem 
to me if there is such a panel, that panel 
would be made up of division person- 
nel rather than international General 
Conference personnel. It seems to me 
that this has potential to open up areas 
of significant concern and significant 
criticism to be directed toward some of 
our institutions. So those are some con- 
cems that I have.

McClure: Thank you. That is helpful. 
You will recall that it is being recom- 
mended that this particular section be 
referred to the Higher Education Cabi- 
net which will be meeting and which

encouraged to develop their own as- 
sessment model so that they will know 
whether or not they are accomplishing 
just that which they are saying they do. 
That I see as the intent of the document 
and I believe personally I think we have 
responsibility as an organization to see 
that that happens whatever responsibil- 
ity we carry, whether it be a conference 
or a union or a division or the General 
Conference itself or an institution—that 
we just make sure that we are able to do 
that which we say we are doing. We 
proclaim that which we say we are 
accomplishing the mission of the church. 
What measures do we take to assess 
that?

H. Bowman: “Total Commitment to God” 
or spiritual accountability? But then I do 
want to express three concerns. One 
concern has been alluded to and that is, 
for many, many years the Seventh-day 
Adventist Church functioned as kind of 
a “top-down” structure. The directions 
came from up above and those of us 
below followed the directions. And we’ve 
been endeavoring to change that for 
some years. Saying that now we want to 
look at the grass roots and find out what 
the needs are and then the service 
organizations up above look at how 
they can meet those needs. This kind of 
flied in the face of that relatively newly 
stated philosophy. Because it comes to 
us saying this has been voted by the 
world church and are we a part of the 
world church? If so, then we need to 
vote to approve it. When those of us at 
least who are leaders of the conferences 
in the North American Division haven’t 
even seen it, that’s out of harmony with 
the method of procedure that we say we 
are following. And so that troubles me 
greatly. I’m troubled with a statement 
here on page 7. “Someday, at the great 
judgment bar, the Lord will ask, ‘What 
have you done, relying on My grace, 
with the gifts, talents, and opportunities 
I gave you?’” I don’t question that God 
is going to be concerned about what we 
have done with the in-filling of grace to 
serve him effectively. But my under- 
standing is that the first question he’s 
going to ask is, “What have you done 
with my Son, Jesus?” It seems that this 
statement, as innocent as it may appear, 
really plays into the hands of those who 
are significantly emphasizing that the 
grace spoken about is power that God



create a document, if we’re going to 
create it, there’s got to be follow through. 
If we’re going to create a document that 
creates accountability, then we’re going 
to have to follow it through or it doesn’t 
mean anything. And when spirituality is 
based on observable facts or numbers 
or behavior, I have a problem with that. 
We had a problem in the 18th century. 
I’m not saying this is where it’s going to 
go, but I think we need to be cautious 
that it could go this way. With the Salem 
witch trials, this is why we have the First 
Amendment. The morality is not sup- 
posed to be legislated.

And one last comment. I found that in 
terms of a person’s spirituality, I think it 
is largely personal. I think that my 
behavior as a teacher, in the way I 
perform, I’m accountable to my super- 
intendent. And there have been times 
when I’ve had suggestions from them to 
improve my teaching that I’ve tried to 
take and has worked very well. But if 
you’re trying to get people to be more 
spiritual and to be more dedicated to 
God, I really think that is the job of the 
Holy Spirit. Other people may disagree 
with me, but looking back over my 10 
years of [being] a teacher, the things that 
have been most effective have [not] 
been things that I have been told to do 
because it’s my job. If I’m speaking and 
giving a Bible lesson to children, I see 
their eyes opening wide and sometimes 
their eyes filling with tears. That’s the 
Holy Spirit; that’s not my superinten- 
dent looking over [my] shoulder. Or this 
past year, when our pastor had a broken 
leg and he was pretty much out of 
action, it was the Holy Spirit that told me 
to get on board with the Net ’96, push it 
through, go to the zoning board meet- 
ings, organize the church. I’m not saying 
that to my credit; I’m just saying that that 
wasn’t because it was some document. 
It was because God was moving me. 
And I’m just not saying that this is 
wrong. I’m saying we need to be very 
cautious. Thank you.

McClure: Thank you. Well stated. I 
would remind you that the recommen- 
dation that follows is that any procedure 
will come back for decision by this 
group next year.

Gordon Bietz (G eorgia-Cumberiand Con- 
ference P resident): This is a real good

the needs that we’re trying to meet. And 
so my concern would be—is—with the 
evaluation, and I don’t see that here, so 
I don’t know how we’re planning to do 
that. But this document, if it is to be 
effective, needs to relate to the fact that 
we are ministering to people that are 
constantly changing. Our methods must 
change. Our focus, even though it is to 
preach the gospel, will probably result 
in many packages. How many of us a 
few years ago would have even con- 
ceived of Net ’95 and ’96? And how 
many are prepared to go to the change 
that will be required of us in the future 
to stay on the cutting edge? Very difficult 
sometimes in assessments to make sure 
that you’re assessing the right thing and 
that we are, in fact, meeting the needs. 
Hopefully this document does not be- 
come a document that gives us a false 
sense of security.

McClure: Good. Thank you for the great 
counsel.

Kevin Sullivan (Atlantic Union): I’m a
school teacher, and this is my first time 
here. And if my remarks sound some- 
what emotional, there’s nothing I can do 
to hide that. I’m speaking with some 
[discomfort] and, as you mentioned your- 
self, Elder McClure, this may sound 
heavy-handed. From my experience, I 
came out of the Roman Catholic Church 
and anything to me that speaks to the 
opening of a door where morality is 
legislated, I react very strongly to. One 
last experience I had with the Roman 
Catholic Church was I had become a 
Christian. I had become converted to 
Christ and I went back to attending the 
Catholic Church, and I remember going 
after Mass to the priest, saying I wanted 
to make a confession, I wanted to make 
things right. And there he stood, looking 
at his watch, with a cigarette in his hand, 
staring out of the window, and I’m 
pouring out my heart to this man. And 
it seemed to me that under these kind of 
guidelines he was doing his job. He 
would have said to his superiors, “Of 
course, you know, here’s a guy coming 
back. I heard his confession.” Maybe 
some kind of notch in his report or in his 
belt, but was he really doing what 
needed to be done, which was giving 
attention to a young person who was 
searching for God? And I would say, No. 
Now, I think the danger is that when we

the body to help me understand what 
that is. And I think there is greater safety 
there. Our whole philosophy of church 
governance is based upon that. I don’t 
decide, for example, that I want to be 
ordained. It is the body that decides 
that. Even the service of marriage is not 
just two people saying, “Well, we want 
to be accountable to each other so we’ll 
go off and do it.” We have accountabil- 
ity within the body. So while I can see 
some reservations, I understand, I think 
I understand, I’m trying to understand 
the concern about assessment. Maybe 
there is a better word someday for 
assessment. But to have someone, for 
instance, in prayer that I’m accountable 
to—that has been very helpful to me. I 
have found it a great blessing. So I hope 
that as we’re thinking about top-down, 
which is a factor that needs to be always 
understood, that we will appreciate the 
need for a broader life. I think if there’s 
anything that we need to fear in this age, 
[it] is our own personal independence— 
that we know that we have all the 
answers. God has chosen as I under- 
stand it to contact us and be in contact 
with us individually. That’s one fact, but 
the whole philosophy of church is mu- 
tual accountability, mutual encourage- 
ment, mutual teaching, and I’m afraid 
that we miss that sometimes, by this 
very earnest desire of saying, “Well, I 
have my direct contact with God.” So, 
Mr. Chairman, I have not read this 
document a great deal in advance my- 
self. I think it’s a safe position to be in as 
we’re working through it. We’re going 
to bump into some things. Maybe that’s 
the good part of the document. It tests 
some of our ideas and reminds us that 
we are a part of a body life.

McClure: Thank you.

Unknown (Arizona Lay D elegate): I guess 
my concern with this document is what’s 
not here. As I read the document, I don’t 
find a great deal of emphasis on the 
management of change. We live in a 
fast-paced society that’s changing right 
before our eyes. And I think we would 
all agree that our doctrines are not 
subject to change, but I would guess 
that everything else ought to be. And 
one of the difficulties of the situation 
like this, is that we can do an assess- 
ment, satisfy ourselves that we have met 
the criteria, and be totally irrelevant to



Unknown: I may be jumping ahead of 
where we’re at just a little bit, but it may 
make us more comfortable perhaps if 
we know where we’re headed, looking 
at these four recommendations that we 
might vote on. If we looked at the fourth 
one and expanded it not only to estab- 
lish procedure but also revising it. If this 
needs strengthening, certainly that’s 
something that we can recommend to 
the General Conference Annual Council 
that they do and certainly as other world 
divisions are reviewing it, they’ll find as 
they try and make application of it that 
it can be clarified in ways that will be 
more helpful in their fields as well. I 
would rather look at this as—well, you 
said it was not a policy, but it’s a 
working document. And we have a 
notebook filled with working docu- 
ments that we’re revising, and I think if 
we can work on revisions of this, be- 
cause it does have many admirable 
goals and aims in it, and if we can make 
it more functional and useful and have 
a committee that would be assigned to 
bring back recommendations not only 
for us to consider but that we could refer 
then to the General Conference as well 
to strengthen and clarify many of the 
concerns that have been expressed. I 
realize, though, that if we did that, the 
first three motions there may need to be 
postponed so that those organizations 
would know just exactly what docu- 
ment they would be responding to. But 
I think it might make us feel better if we 
knew that this was a document that was 
going to receive further work and clan- 
fication.

McClure: All right. Thank you. Obvi- 
ously this is not etched in stone. I think 
we need to look at it in a way that has 
been suggested. We can make sugges- 
tions for change, but concurrently we 
ought to look at how we might feel it is 
appropriate that we respond to the 
suggestion made here.

Unknown: I’m glad to see my namesake 
at the other mike because I was hoping 
to hear something about how the docu- 
ment was developed and put into place 
at the higher bodies. I would like to hear 
that.

McClure: All right. Thank you. Elder 
Thompson, would you like to com- 
ment?

the document, I wouldn’t have any 
trouble with. I think it is a fine descrip- 
tion of what we might be, but I would 
like to come back again to the question 
of the assessment, a word that appears 
quite frequently in the document. In a 
discussion with one of the delegates a 
few minutes ago that stood at this micro- 
phone, you indicated that there was no 
attempt to spiritually assess individu- 
als—church members—and that’s I think 
quite correct, but I do notice on page 
four under the pastor, [at] the very 
bottom of the first column it says, “The 
division will facilitate the development 
of an assessment model, to be imple- 
mented by each union/local confer- 
ence, which includes a self-assessment 
module” and so forth, and this is in 
connection with where it talks about 
spiritual outcome. Now, it’s a little vague, 
maybe, the way it’s worded, but I’m 
wondering if this means that the divi- 
sion office is going to prepare some 
kind of an assessment instrument that 
will assess the spirituality of each pastor. 
I mean, it could be interpreted that way. 
If so, I have several [questions] and then 
I would assume that if that’s true that 
that might be true with the workers in 
the various institutions whether they are 
elementary, secondary, health institu- 
tions, or colleges/universities, food ser- 
vices, or whatever. I have quite a bit of 
experience with assessment instruments, 
as you may know, and spirituality is a 
very difficult thing to assess with an 
instrument. There are some instruments 
that do attempt to assess spirituality, and 
they may have some usefulness when 
they are used for self evaluation and this 
type of thing. But I think the underlying 
question in this document, which it 
doesn’t ever state, one way or the other, 
but the underlying question is, Are these 
assessments to be used for hiring and 
firing? Are we talking about employ- 
ment through this type of thing? Would 
people be assessed and then be dis- 
charged from their jobs or refused jobs 
because of this assessment? That would 
be a rather risky piece of instrument. I 
don’t say that it says that, but the under- 
lying tone suggests that it might possibly 
be, and I think we need to bring that out 
in the open and ask the question, if 
that’s what we are talking about.

McClure: I couldn’t agree with you 
more, Roger.

news, bad news document. I think there 
are some very positive things. Many of 
us in leadership positions are always 
trying to figure out ways to have better 
relationships of accountability with 
people that we work with and I think 
that that is some very positive side of 
that. It could, however, look like an 
audit. And I think that some of us might 
have a little angst if the audit was 
conducted by the General Conference 
committee rather than my nominating 
committee. My nominating committee 
audits me every three years quite care- 
fully, and I think that the prime locus for 
that kind of activity comes through the 
presently constituted bodies rather than 
shuffling those responsibilities to bod- 
ies that are not in the present organiza- 
tion. The real devil is going to be in the 
details of how this is implemented and 
produced, and I think that’s where the 
people that you choose to put on those 
committees that are going to come back 
to us with the recommendations are 
going to be making the kinds of deci- 
sions that . . .  well, we’ll have a lot more 
discussion next time, probably. Thanks.

H arrison P erla (C entral California Con- 
ference): Mr. Chairperson, I think this 
document has an incredible amount of 
potential and it’s definitely heading in 
the right direction; however, the motion 
at hand is to accept this document, and 
I have a problem with the fact [that] 
apparently it’s been accepted already by 
a higher body. So the motion in itself is 
inappropriate. It’s evident by the num- 
ber of comments that there is an incred- 
ible amount of discussion still needed 
on this document, at least among the 
North American Division delegates, and 
our suggestion is—I think what I’m 
hearing—is that we’d like some time to 
study this. So the motion, I think, needs 
to be amended or a previous gentleman’s 
comments were that the minutes could 
state that it was presented. I’m not sure 
that we’re accepting it. We feel it needs 
more revision.

McClure: Thank you. The motion is to 
accept and record it in our minutes with 
the proposal that we will then deal with 
how we direct it at that point.

Roger D udley ( Institute of C hurch M in- 
istry, Andrews University): The de-
scription of total commitment to God in



Then it went to the floor of the Annual 
Council for discussion and everything 
else and so it has come to us. Nothing 
that the General Conference votes is like 
the laws of the Medes and Persians. 
That’s why even policies and recom- 
mendations and guidelines voted by 
this church are dynamic. They can be 
changed at any Annual Council as expe- 
dient in implementation as the field 
dictates. So the answer to whether or 
not this is stuck like this for the rest of 
time and eternity, no. Observations will 
come from all the world divisions—not 
just one, all the world divisions—and 
then if it seen fit that something needs to 
be changed through the regular process 
of change that we bring through Annual 
Council, it will be done. But indeed the 
world divisions, together, including 
North America at an Annual Council 
discussed this document, voted it, and I 
think, Brother Chairman, what you have 
done here with the four recommended 
areas to go is the area in which every 
division should be working and will be 
working as to how they will now imple- 
ment or go about implementing some of 
the things that are written here and each

to go to the Far Eastern Division, which 
will be changed in name. The Northern 
Asia Pacific Division next time. If we 
don’t, then we’ll go back to Brazil, 
which will be the South American Divi- 
sion in 1998. So, you know, we’ve got to 
remember the governance system of the 
church, which works, and that each one 
of us cannot be present for every meet- 
ing to speak for ourselves. Somebody 
speaks for us. And when we take an 
action at the General Conference An- 
nual Council, with that kind of represen- 
tation from the world field, including 
our own division leadership, then even 
though I may not agree with every word 
or sentence or expression, I can’t say I 
wasn’t represented. We were repre- 
sented. Our leaders were there. And 
within the governance of the church, 
that’s how it operates.

Now this paper, as you know, has been 
long in being bom. It went through 
many, many, many different revisions 
and additions—emendations. Sent out 
to the world division leaders for their 
input. And it came through the process 
to the GC officers and division officers.

Thompson: Yes, Mr. Chairman. I wanted 
to talk about the top-down, bottom-up 
references. I think we must remember 
that the Annual Council and this past 
quinquennium, two of them have [been] 
outside the United States. Three of them 
will be held here. According to the 
constitutional provisions voted at Utrecht 
last year, all the world union presidents 
. . . have been members of the GC 
Committee for many, many years but 
never attended. Provisions have been 
made for them to attend, so they were 
all there—all the world union presi- 
dents. From every division we have 
three lay persons plus pastors plus front 
line workers from each division. Then in 
the division where the Annual Council 
is held, all conference or mission presi- 
dents are voted to attend with voice and 
vote. So three out of the five annual 
councils within the quinquennium will 
be held here in this division with all the 
North American local conference presi- 
dents in attendance with voice and vote. 
Now I heard that there is a document 
that North American presidents weren’t 
there. Well, when we vote Annual Coun- 
cil actions during those three times 
when it is held here with all North 
American Division union presidents, 
conference presidents, all of the other 
conference presidents of the 11 other 
divisions would have to say, “Well, I 
was represented.” So I hope when the 
shoe is on the other foot, we recognize 
that we are engaged in a world church. 
And when you have all the world union 
presidents, when you have pastors and 
divisions of the world, when you have 
lay members from the world, when you 
have the whole world division officers 
present—now, according to how this 
church works, we are a representative 
body. We can’t invite 9,055,000 mem- 
bers that we now have to an Annual 
Council. Hence, I have to conclude that 
within the representative form of this 
church, with all the union presidents of 
North America and the division officers, 
including those of the other world fields, 
they represent me. I may not agree with 
everything that was voted, but certainly 
as we work as a world church, that’s the 
representative process. And the North 
American group will have more to say to 
the world than the other group because 
you will have three of these Annual 
Councils held here where in one divi- 
sion one will be held. We were hoping

VOTED Action:

581-96N TOTAL COMMITMENT TO GOD—A DECLARATION OF SPIRI- 
TUAL ACCOUNTABILITY IN THE FAMILY OF FAITH

VOTED, 1. To receive the document entitled, Total Commitment to God, A 
Declaration of Spiritual Accountability in the Family of Faith, with the 
following recommendations for action:

2. To refer to the Health Care Summit in December 1996, questions about the 
implementation and any necessary revisions of the Total Commitment To 
God document sections that relate to Health Care institutions.

3• To refer to the North American Division Higher Education Summit in 
December 1996 questions about the implementation and any necessary 
revisions of the Total Commitment To God document sections that relate to 
colleges and universities.

4. To ask the North American Division Office of Education, along with the 
Union Directors of Education, to develop spiritual assessment models for use 
by K-l 2 schools and any necessary revisions to the Total Commitment To God 
document. The proposed models will be submitted to the NAD Board of 
Education, K-l2 in February 1998.

5. To establish a representative committee to be determined by the chair to 
establish procedures for implementing other sections and necessary revisions 
of the Total Commitment To God document.



tioned what we’re doing, you’ve changed 
the actual words and I would feel real 
comfortable with the last time you did it 
you sounded like that’s what you were 
meaning, but earlier you had said that 
we’re accepting it. And I just wanted to 
be really clear before we vote what the 
intent is.

McClure: OK. Thank you. Elder Baptiste, 
would you restate the motion?

Baptiste: To be historically accurate, 
Brother Chairman, I use the word adopt. 
When I made the motion I used the 
word adopt. We can modify that, but 
that was my perception at the time.

McClure: I’m sorry, I didn’t hear you. 
The motion before us is to receive the 
document. Yes, please.

Mark Bueler (F lorida Conference): Mr.
Chairman, my name is Mark Bueler, I’m 
a layman down there. You’ve men- 
tioned several times that the assessment 
process seems to be established by the 
division or the General Conference in 
most of the cases where it refers to an 
assessment. So I think there needs to be 
some clarification. It may be that the 
local, that the governing body actually 
implements whatever the process is, but 
it seems that the assessment process 
itself is division-generated or General 
Conference-generated.

McClure: Thank you for the clarifica- 
tion. I believe it is the intent that the 
assessment activity would take place at 
the level at which it is appropriate. 
However, it is suggested concurrently 
that a process be developed so that 
there is some uniformity in dealing with 
the various organizations, but that the 
assessment activity take place within 
the organization itself. Does that help? I 
see no one at the microphone. We’re 
ready to vote on the motion that is to 
receive the document. All who favor the 
document please say, ״Aye.” Opposed, 
“No.” That is carried. Now do you wish 
to take an action on the implementation 
procedure. All right, you have the rec- 
ommendation before you, it’s been read 
once. Do you want to hear it read again? 
It’s been moved and seconded. Yes, 
please.

Unknown: I would move that we amend

Spring, Maryland, church. While as a lay 
person I am all for more accountability 
on the part of our church institutions, I 
believe that that accountability rests 
with the local governing board and that 
we are to some degree trying to usurp or 
supersede the power of the local confer- 
ence executive committee, the local 
school board, the local college board— 
and I really wonder where we’re going 
with this document. Thank you.

McClure: Thank you. Once again, we’re 
simply, we have before us a motion to 
record in our minutes that we have 
heard, reviewed the document. We’re 
not suggesting that it must be assimi- 
lated at this point. We’re suggesting that 
it be done over the course of the next 
year and that we put in place, we assign 
a certain group responsibility for help- 
ing us to design ways in which we might 
address this document. The thing that I 
think is important to also reiterate, it is, 
I believe, designed to provide for the 
governing body of those organizations 
to be the one who makes the assess- 
ment. So I hope we don’t become too 
concerned at this point before we see 
how we will decide to enact or to work 
on or to respond to that which is being 
suggested here. Are you ready to vote?

Unknown: I think you have dealt with 
most of what I was planning on saying, 
but perhaps a little word could help here. 
In church assemblies in other denomina- 
tions, interchurch assemblies, too, there 
is a term that is used often with docu- 
ments that are taken to the assembly and 
in this case may fit. To receive the 
document and then have the time as it 
has been already suggested to study that 
in more detail. We are really not pre- 
pared after just seeing the document for 
a few minutes to give definitive answers. 
And I think the proposal with the four 
actions suggested would allow commit- 
tees to study it in more detail and bring 
whatever good recommendations come 
out of those committees to the year-end 
meetings this next year. So I’m just sug- 
gesting the possibility of using the term to 
receive the document as an option.

McClure: That is fully the intent. Thank 
you very much for the clarification.

Mary Lou Toop (C anadian Union): My
question was, every time you’ve men­

division will probably be different in its 
implementation. Thank you.

McClure: Thank you, Elder Thompson.

J udy St. J ohn (P acific Union): Thank 
you, Mr. Chairman. Now I know how 
Bob Dole must feel when he has to 
follow Bill Clinton in one of the debates. 
That was very moving. Thank you. My 
name is Judy St. John. I’m a lay represen- 
tative from the Pacific Union. I’ve been 
interested in the comments that have 
been going on today about top-down 
versus bottom-up. This is my first time to 
ever attend one of these meetings, and 
I’m struggling to understand a lot of 
what is going on. However, I would like 
to make a few comments about this 
document. In our U.S. Constitution, if a 
revision is wanting to be made, then it 
seems to me that it may be passed by 
Congress but then it is voted on by each 
individual state before that change is 
made. We’re caught in sort of a “Catch- 
22” situation right now because there 
are those of us who may have reseiva- 
tions about this, and yet we’re already 
being told that it is being imposed on us 
by a vote of the world church. So in one 
sense I’m not quite sure why we’re 
wasting our time in debate because it 
seems to me it is somewhat of a fore- 
gone conclusion and yet we’re called to 
be here to represent our church and to 
think about these matters. Maybe some 
of you have seen this document before, 
as this gentleman alluded to, but you 
know I was handed it 10 minutes ago or 
15 minutes ago and it was read through 
and now we’re expected to assimilate 
all of it and to understand it. We’re 
already a church that is perceived by the 
outside world as having rule upon rule 
upon rule upon rule. Sometimes I think 
we’re like the scribes and the Pharisees, 
and now we’re being asked to adopt still 
another set of rules. It makes me won- 
der whether we really believe that we’re 
saved by works or saved by faith. One 
problem that I have with this is that if the 
local program, whatever it may be, of a 
school, a church, a college, a confer- 
ence is being assessed, the people who 
are doing the assessment may not per- 
ceive that that institution is fulfilling the 
local need. Because the needs of my 
church in Newbury Park, California, for 
instance, may be vastly different from 
the local church needs of the Silver



I’m not 100 percent sure of the structure 
of everything, but my question has to do 
with something on page six with the 
Adventist institutions for mass commu- 
nication, including the ABCs and the 
publishing houses. It's the first point 
saying that “distribution only of that 
which contributes to gospel proclama- 
tion and the nurturing of church mem- 
bers.” I know in the ABC they sell non- 
denominational literature plus games 
and food and lots of stuff that doesn’t 
proclaim the gospel. So I’m just wonder- 
ing, is there a body like the Health Care 
Summit or something that those things 
would be referred to specifically so 
they’re dealt with by the publishing 
house boards or whatever?

McClure: I think the motion before us at 
the moment provides for that possibil- 
ity.

Toop: OK. So that would probably go for 
that.

McClure: Are you ready to vote on the 
motion? All in favor, please say “Aye.” 
Opposed, “No.” It’s carried. We have 
come to a point in the day that there is 
probably not a lot of need for trying to 
do something else before we eat. There 
are some announcements that we need 
to make and Elder Jacobsen, would you 
please bring those on. Yes . . .

Unknown: Mr. Chairman, I’m sorry to 
pause here, but it was my understand- 
ing there was an amendment to the 
motion on the floor. And we sort of 
voted everything in one capsule there, 
and I’m not quite sure what we voted.

McClure: Thank you very much for 
helping the chair to come to his senses. 
In the mind of the chair, we were voting 
on the document, but perhaps we ought 
to make clear what we were doing and 
therefore we ought to back up and take 
a motion on the amendment which is to 
add the wording, please.

Baptiste: To add the wording—let me 
get my notes—to provide for recom- 
mendations of revisions and under rec- 
ommendation number four. So that this 
small committee, we’ll edit it appropri- 
ately, but it would read something like 
this: To establish a representative com- 
mittee to be determined by the chair to

it’s been stated by Elder Thompson the 
process this has gone through. We have 
certainly been represented there, and 
it’s not our position as a body here at the 
North American Division to reorganize 
this document or edit or adjust this 
document. So I would have a problem 
with a portion of this motion.

McClure: It is my recommendation that 
this body, as being suggested here, 
would make suggestions to the appro- 
priate body for change. I concur with 
you that I don’t think we have the 
authority to change the document.

Malcolm: Recommendations could be 
made or appeals made to the body, but 
changes, no.

McClure: Rick, is that your understand- 
ing?

Unknown: Yes.

McClure: Yes, please.

Unknown: If this doesn’t have the au- 
thority of a policy, why can it not be 
altered? I mean, if it’s only a working 
document, can not that be adapted to 
that division?

McClure: You’re asking some very dif- 
ficult questions. (Laughter.) My answer 
to that is, No. (Laughter.)

D ale Kongorski (Alberta Conference 
P resident): I have a question on the 
amendment that has been offered. If it’s 
an appropriate amendment because it 
seems to me that indeed it would, it is 
hostile to the intention of the original 
motion which was to adopt these four 
things. The adopting of the amendment 
would pretty much eliminate the first 
three items on this sheet because really 
how can these different groups address 
the document if the document is under 
revision? How would they address the 
implementation of the document if they 
don’t know what it is they’re imple- 
menting? And so it seems to me that it is 
almost a hostile amendment which is 
not allowable.

McClure: Thank you.

Toop: I’m Mary Lou Toop from the 
Canadian Union and I’m a lay person, so

the fourth one to establish procedures 
for implementing and revising. Well, 
I’m wanting something broader than 
that because I’m not just wanting the 
other sections of the “Total Commit- 
ment” document, but I’d like to em- 
power this representative committee to 
bring back proposed revisions to any 
part of the document to us next year. 
And however the secretary would like 
to incorporate that into a revised vote 
motion, I’d be happy for that. But I’d like 
for the intent to be that not only imple- 
mentation, but also the very document 
itself with proposed revisions come back 
next year.

McClure: I’m not sure I understand your 
intent. Is it your intent that the proposed 
revisions be recommended to the body 
from which it was voted?

Unknown: No . Whether we have this 
representative committee bring back a 
report next year, not only with pro- 
posed implementation, but proposed 
revisions, if necessary, to the document 
itself. We still have not adopted the 
document, so I’m assuming at some 
point down the road we are going to 
have to adopt it. So I’m wanting to ask 
that this committee . . . bring back 
revisions in a document that we could 
consider for adoption later on.

McClure: Is there support for that am end- 
ment?

H. Baptiste: I’m suggesting—if I under- 
stand you carefully—I think you’re sug- 
gesting that it should read something 
like this: “To establish a representative 
committee to be determined by the 
chair to establish procedures for imple- 
menting and revising”—just simply “add 
and revising sections of the Total Com- 
mitment’ document.” Just want the com- 
mittee to also bring revisions.

Unknown: Bring revisions.

McClure: Suggested revisions.

Elmer Malcolm (N orthern N ew England 
Conference P resident): I had a question 
regarding revisions of the document. It 
doesn’t seem to me that we have the 
authority to revise the document. We 
may have the authority to make deci- 
sions in addressing the document, but



those first two points on the document 
as well. And I would move that amend- 
ment.

McClure: OK. Ready to vote on that 
amendment? All in favor please say— 
no, raise the hand. Thank you. Those 
opposed, the same sign. Well, we got 
closer to unanimity on that one than we 
did the first one. Now, Elder Jacobsen. 
You can see I’m hungry. Ready to vote 
on the main motion? All those in favor 
please say, ״Aye.” Opposed, ״No.” It’s 
carried.

of the motion please raise the hand. 
Thank you. Those opposed, the same 
sign. It’s carried.

Unknown: Mr. Chairman, I believe that if 
we revise or amend the last point on this 
page here, that we really ought to do the 
same for the first two points, because as 
it is stated here, the expectation is that 
these two summits would implement, 
would discuss implementation of the 
document, and have no context in terms 
of revision or its impact. It seems to me 
that same revision ought to be done for

establish procedures for implementing 
of the sections of the total document 
and recommendations for revisions.

McClure: D o you w ish  to  speak  to  that?

Unknown: I’ll speak after they vote on 
that.

McClure: Let's vote on that amendment. 
All in favor please say, ״Aye.” Opposed, 
 No.” Let’s try again. All in favor, please״
say, ״Aye.” Opposed, ״No.” We’re not 
ready to go to lunch, are we? All in favor


